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[music] 

Paul Thies: Members of the armed forces are used to contending with stressful 
situations. However, making the move from deployment to employment as a civilian 
professional brings with it a different set of challenges. Hello, I'm your host, Paul 
Thies. In this episode of If/When, we discuss how service members can successfully 
embark on the next phase of their careers with Issac Barnes, President of Eminent 
Future, and Cleo Thomas, Vice President and Director of Operation for Jacobs 
Global Digital Center of Excellence. 

Isaac and Cleo are both fantastic examples of service members who are able to 
parlay their military experiences into rewarding post-military careers. After serving in 
the US Army for 25 years, achieving the rank of colonel, and serving in the White 
House under President Obama, Cleo now manages operational priorities to ensure 
the successful integration of innovations in support of Jacob's Global Mission. A 
former US Marine, Isaac made history earlier this year as his Black-owned tech 
company, Eminent Future was awarded a $13.4 billion defense contract with the 
Pentagon, White House, and US State Department. 

In the discussion that follows, Isaac and Cleo shared how they got started in the 
military, what they learned along the way, and the advice they would pass along to 
their comrades in arms who are preparing to take their own next steps. I found that 
the recommendations they shared are just as applicable for non-military 
professionals too. I hope you enjoy our conversation. 

Isaac and Cleo, thank you both so much for joining me today. I'm really fascinated to 
talk with you about transitioning from the military into civilian life. I really can't think of 
two finer gentlemen that I wanted to talk to about this than both of you. You've got 
amazing backgrounds. You're doing amazing things. I think it's really helpful for 
gentlemen like yourselves who are in leadership roles where you can mentor to, say, 
younger folks maybe, or maybe even not-so-younger folks who are transitioning out 
of military active duty and are looking to move into the civilian life. I just want to start 
by thanking you both for joining me today. 

Cleo Thomas: Hey. Thanks for having us, Paul. I really appreciate it. 

Isaac Barnes: Absolutely. Thanks for having us, Paul. 

Paul: 
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My father passed away in 2000. One of the things that I did shortly after that was 
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out, I think about 2005, I think it was, and you began your professional career, or I 
should say your civilian professional career. 

Isaac: Excuse me. Yes. 

Paul: What are some leadership insights you gained during the course of your 
tenure in the military that you think are particularly relevant for someone embarking 
on a corporate career or a civilian career? 

Isaac: That's a fantastic question. I think the best way that I can shape it is to take 
you back to boot camp, because I think that's where the leadership lessons truly 
began, especially for Marines. One of the early experiences I had and the slap-in-
the-face moments I had learning leadership the hard way was during one of our PT 
sessions during boot camp. It was a mile-and-a-half run. This was one of the first 
times I had ever run over a mile. I'm running, and I'm running, and I'm running, and 
all of a sudden, I got about three-quarters of the way through the first mile, and I felt 
like I got hit by a semi-truck. 

My lungs just felt like they were going to collapse, and I look around, and one of the 
drill instructors, he's looking at me, he's like, "Don't think about quitting." I was like, 
"But I want to quit." He's like, "No. You don't quit until you're throwing up." In that 
moment, I'm looking, I'm like, "Quitting until I throw up. I'm going to quit way before I 
throw up." Then he said to me, he was like, "Look, how many of these guys around 
you have stopped so far because they can't go anymore, and they're throwing up?" I 
was like, "Probably about four or five I've seen so far." He's like, "Yes, exactly." He's 
like, "Has that happened to you yet?" 

I said, "No." He's like, "Well, that means you can keep going. If your body's not giving 
you clear signals like that, then that means you could keep going." In that moment, I 
felt the switch in my mind. My whole perception of what I was doing changed. I was 
like, "Okay, it's really my mind playing these tricks on me, my body is actually fine." 
In that moment, I felt my entire being just relaxing and calm down." I tell that story 
because that stayed with me throughout the rest of my military career, and it still 
stays with me until this day. There's always these moments in life where we feel like 
we can't keep going, or we feel like we've had enough, but ultimately, there's always 
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Cleo: 
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Isaac: I think Cleo touched on some of the key resources that are available to 
veterans. They give us the PTAP training when you come out, you get the transition 
training where they walk you through some of the basics of what you can expect 
through your transition and trying to prepare you for civilian life as best as they can. I 
think taking advantage of that is definitely crucial but the people that I've seen that 
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a civilian. I think that's one of the biggest things that I see people transitioning out of 
the military struggle with. 

Then also I think one of the other big things is just having confidence. Knowing that 
you have been prepared for some of the most difficult circumstances a human could 
ever face in life. That will show up in moments of crisis, moments of chaos, moments 
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Paul: So people can see the impact that you're able to have. 

Cleo: Exactly. 

Paul: This has been super fascinating. I'm listening to both of you, and I did not 
serve in the military. It's like there's just so many gems here that I wish, when I was a 
young person, a much younger person, that I had heard this stuff, and that I had 
known this stuff when I was just getting in college and getting out. I think a lot of what 
you both shared resonates even beyond the military. 

Obviously, it's very, very helpful for people who are in the military, but I think 
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[00:42:03] [END OF AUDIO] 


